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“She remembered when Hemingway had planted a banyan tree at his house and told her its parasitic
roots were like human desire. At the time she’d thought it romantic. She hadn’t understood his warning.”

In Depression-era Key West, Mariella Bennet, the daughter of an American fisherman and a Cuban woman,
knows hunger. Her struggle to support her family following her father’s death leads her to a bar and bordello,
where she bets on a risky boxing match...and attracts the interest of two men: world-famous writer, Ernest
Hemingway, and Gavin Murray, one of the WWI veterans who are laboring to build the Overseas Highway. 

When Mariella is hired as a maid by Hemingway’s second wife, Pauline, she enters a rarified world of
lavish, celebrity-filled dinner parties and elaborate off-island excursions. As she becomes caught up in the
tensions and excesses of the Hemingway household, the attentions of the larger-than-life writer become a
dangerous temptation...even as straightforward Gavin Murray draws her back to what matters most.  Will she
cross an invisible line with the volatile Hemingway, or find a way to claim her own dreams?  As a massive
hurricane bears down on Key West, Mariella faces some harsh truths...and the possibility of losing
everything she loves.
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From reader reviews:

Margie Turner:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Hemingway's Girl. All type of book is
it possible to see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Bruce Brown:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And
you have spare time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They should answer that
question because just their can do this. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
appropriate. Because start from on pre-school until university need this particular Hemingway's Girl to read.

Barbra Poole:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals
to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Looking at a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Hemingway's Girl book because book
offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no
doubt in it you know.

Doris Whobrey:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
a book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent all day every
day to reading a e-book. The book Hemingway's Girl it is quite good to read. There are a lot of individuals
who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have
enough space bringing this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this
book from your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book has high quality.
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