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A scientist’s miraculous discovery pits him against a multinational drug company in a fight for his life

Richard Parnell is one of the leading minds in gene therapy research, and he expects the job at Dubette, Inc.,
to be his first step to a Nobel Prize. But when he arrives at the American pharmaceutical giant, he finds
himself shut out of the main avenues of research, isolated from the cutting edge in a way he has never been
before.
 
To force his way into the inner circle, he must forgo ethics. By testing a new gene therapy on human
subjects, Parnell hits upon something miraculous. A shot from his syringe makes AIDS victims recover and
tumors disappear. The corporate heads at Dubette are thrilled, and rush Parnell’s brilliant discovery to
market. But what is he to do when he learns that, far from being a miracle cure, his breakthrough may
actually be a recipe for certain death?
 
This ebook features an illustrated biography of Brian Freemantle including rare photos from the author’s
personal collection.
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From reader reviews:

Christina Bain:

What do you concerning book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you need something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They must answer that question simply
because just their can do that. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
appropriate. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this particular Dead End to read.

Gerald Conway:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
family members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just
watching TV, or maybe playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that's look
different you can read the book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you simply read
you can spent all day every day to reading a book. The book Dead End it is extremely good to read. There
are a lot of folks that recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In the event you
did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore quickly to
read this book from the smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book possesses high quality.

Christopher Hannah:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its cover may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer may be Dead End why because the fantastic cover that make you
consider concerning the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the
outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Tanya McNeil:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you read
a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. In order to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Dead End provide you with a new experience in looking at a book.
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