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A chance encounter, a chance at love...and one heartbreaking choice. A Conduct Unbecoming sequel. Ensign
Aiden Lange is taking a hike-and it's not for the pleasure of seeing Okinawa's Hiji Falls. It's in the hope that
claiming he took a fall on the rocks will cover up the fact he was beaten up in a gay bar. Not a place a Naval
Academy grad wants to get caught if he's serious about his career. At the end of the trail, a surprise comes
with the scenery. A gorgeous young guy in swim trunks. Connor didn't come up to the falls to find a man,
but he's instantly intrigued by the ensign with the bandaged eyebrow. A hike turns into dinner, and before he
knows it, he's up to his heart in love with the gentle, infinitely patient Aiden. It's a small world, though, and
an even smaller island. It's only a matter of time before they're caught by a man who's more than just
Connor's overprotective father. He's also Aiden's high-ranking boss. Someone with the power to force Aiden
to choose-Connor, or his naval career. Warning: Contains two adorable guys who don't give a damn that the
deck's stacked against them, plenty of sex on the beach, and the hottest application of sunscreen you've ever
read.
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From reader reviews:

Louise Richards:

This General Misconduct are reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The reason why
of this General Misconduct can be among the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than
just simple reading food but feed an individual with information that maybe will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions
both in e-book and printed versions. Beside that this General Misconduct giving you an enormous of
experience like rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day
exercise. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Bobby Kile:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine you can have
the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like General Misconduct which is having the
e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Clara Bearden:

You can find this General Misconduct by browse the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it could
possibly to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are
various. Not only through written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era
similar to now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now,
choose your own ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to
make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.

Robert Ford:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled update of news.
On this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just searching for the General Misconduct when you needed it?
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