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Red beans and rice, trad jazz, and second lines are the Big Easy's calling cards, but beyond where the
carriage rides take you is a city brimming with genre-defying music, transnational cuisine, and pockets of
wild, artistic locals that challenge preconceived notions of what it means to be New Orleans.

With a respectful nod to the traditional and a full embrace of the obscure, New Orleans: The Underground
Guide is a resource for discovering the city as it really is -- as much brass bands and boas as it is bounce and
bicycle tours. From a speakeasy in the Bywater neighborhood to the delightfully sketchy vibe of St. Roch
Tavern, lead author Michael Patrick Welch uncovers an unexpected tableau of musicians, venues, and novel
ways to pass the bon temps.

Contents include but are not limited to: where to get naked, how to make the most of Mardi Gras according
to banjo player Geoff Douville, what to order from the delicious Slavic menu at Siberia, where to find the
New Orleans Giant Puppet Festival, how to catch a performance by the New Movement comedy troupe,
where to rent a kayak, and how to get in on the "bed and beverage" experience at the Royal Street Inn.
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From reader reviews:

Melvin Wilhelm:

In other case, little folks like to read book New Orleans: The Underground Guide. You can choose the best
book if you want reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a book New Orleans: The
Underground Guide. You can add information and of course you can around the world by the book.
Absolutely right, simply because from book you can realize everything! From your country till foreign or
abroad you will be known. About simple point until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era,
we could open a book as well as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You should use it when
you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's read.

Agnes Figueroa:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book New Orleans: The
Underground Guide. All type of book are you able to see on many resources. You can look for the internet
options or other social media.

Albertha Lemons:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man or woman?
If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And
you have extra time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They should answer that
question simply because just their can do that will. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person.
Yes, it is correct. Because start from on guardería until university need that New Orleans: The Underground
Guide to read.

Lorraine Bryant:

Here thing why this particular New Orleans: The Underground Guide are different and dependable to be
yours. First of all reading through a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of computer which is
the content is as yummy as food or not. New Orleans: The Underground Guide giving you information
deeper since different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no reserve that similar with New
Orleans: The Underground Guide. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your eyes about the thing
that will happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can actually bring
everywhere like in area, café, or even in your method home by train. When you are having difficulties in
bringing the printed book maybe the form of New Orleans: The Underground Guide in e-book can be your
substitute.
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