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“Anyone who doubts the power of history to inform the present should read this closely argued and sweeping
survey. This is rich, timely, and sobering historical fare written in a measured, non-sensationalist style by a
master of his craft. One only hopes (almost certainly vainly) that today’s policymakers take its lessons to
heart.”—Brian Fagan, Los Angeles Times 

Published in 2002, Deforesting the Earth was a landmark study of the history and geography of
deforestation. Now available as an abridgment, this edition retains the breadth of the original while rendering
its arguments accessible to a general readership.  

Deforestation—the thinning, changing, and wholesale clearing of forests for fuel, shelter, and agriculture—is
among the most important ways humans have transformed the environment. Surveying ten thousand years to
trace human-induced deforestation’s effect on economies, societies, and landscapes around the world,
Deforesting the Earth is the preeminent history of this process and its consequences. 

Beginning with the return of the forests after the ice age to Europe, North America, and the tropics, Michael
Williams traces the impact of human-set fires for gathering and hunting, land clearing for agriculture, and
other activities from the Paleolithic age through the classical world and the medieval period. He then focuses
on forest clearing both within Europe and by European imperialists and industrialists abroad, from the 1500s
to the early 1900s, in such places as the New World, India, and Latin America, and considers indigenous
clearing in India, China, and Japan.  Finally, he covers the current alarming escalation of deforestation, with
our ever-increasing human population placing a potentially unsupportable burden on the world’s forests.
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From reader reviews:

Donn Chavez:

The e-book with title Deforesting the Earth: From Prehistory to Global Crisis, An Abridgment includes a lot
of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist new
expertise the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world today. That is
important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within new
era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere
you want.

Ian Coghlan:

Why? Because this Deforesting the Earth: From Prehistory to Global Crisis, An Abridgment is an unordinary
book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will shock you with the secret
the item inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who else write the book in such awesome
way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning
thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This
phenomenal book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book possess such as help improving your
skill and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were you I will go
to the book store hurriedly.

Brooke Jenkins:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short time to read it because this all time you only find guide that need more
time to be read. Deforesting the Earth: From Prehistory to Global Crisis, An Abridgment can be your answer
as it can be read by you who have those short free time problems.

Fred Swett:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just watching
TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by examining a book. Ugh, you think
reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you can have the e-
book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Deforesting the Earth: From Prehistory to
Global Crisis, An Abridgment which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
notice.
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